
shout when they heard the sound of 
the trumpets. 

Joshua didn't argue with God. He 

didn't say, "This doesn't make sense. I 
can think of a better plan than that!" 

No, he didn't say any of those things. 
He trusted God. And the people of Israel 
wanted to do what Joshua told them. 

They didn't understand, but they knew 
that if God told them to do something, 

He would help them to do it. 

I wonder what the people of Jericho 
thought on that first day as they 
watched the people of Israel march 
around their city? They probably 
wondered what was going to happen. 
No doubt they grew more worried as 

each day went by. 
Day after day the people of Israel 

marched around Jericho. On the 
seventh day, the people of Jericho 
again heard the sound of the seven 

trumpets. But the people of Israel 
marched quietly around the city. One 
time. Two times. Three. Four. Five. 
Six. Then on the seventh time, when 
the priests blew their trumpets, 
Joshua commanded the people to 
shout! He said, "The Lord has given 

you the city!" At that moment, giant 
cracks appeared in those huge walls. 
Then, with a mighty crash, the walls 
fell to the ground! 

Joshua and the people of Israel took 
over the city of Jericho. God was able 
to help them win the battle because 
Joshua trusted God and did exactly 
what God had told him to do. 

Where Is the Army? 
Draw people marching around the walls of Jericho. 


