
Moses, were Joshua and Caleb. Both 
were men who loved and trusted God. 
They believed God and obeyed Him. 

For forty days the spies searched 
through the land of Canaan. They 
must have been excited by what they 
found. The land was beautiful. It had 
flowing rivers and lots of trees and 
good fruit. When it was time to leave, 
the men cut down one cluster of 
grapes to take back to Moses. That 
cluster was so big that it took two 
strong men to carry it! 

The twelve spies told Moses that 
everything was exactly like God had 
said it would be. But ten of the spies 
were afraid. When they looked at the 
land they saw the high-walled cities 
and the people of the land who looked 

like giants. Those ten spies said, "We 
cannot take this land! We are not able 
to do it." They forgot that God had 
promised to help them. They forgot 
that God had said the land would be 
theirs. 

Joshua and Caleb didn't forget. 
They trusted God and knew He would 
give them the land. Caleb told Moses 
and the people, "We can take this 
land! God is on our side." But the 
people were afraid. They listened to 
the other ten spies. They didn't 
believe Joshua and Caleb. They, too, 
forgot God's promise. 

Many years later Joshua and Caleb 
were the only two of those twelve spies 
who went into the promised land with 
the Children of Israel. 

True or False 

What information did the spies bring back about Canaan? Mark the sentences 
below either true or false. 

T F 

There were only a few people in Canaan. 

The people were strong. 

The people did not live in a city. 

The land was good. 

There were giants in the land. 

The fruit was spoiled. 


